
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
September 7, 2012 Miscellaneous Food Items, RFP #130403 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
A ten (10) month agreement to provide miscellaneous frozen, canned and packaged foods as 
stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District.  
Fourteen (14) items bid; twelve (12) items awarded.  Items will be purchased as needed to meet 
breakfast and lunch menu requirements.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.   
 
Effective Dates:  October 1, 2012 through July 31, 2013. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
Food Services 
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:                   ITEMS AWARDED:          ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE: 

 
Butler Foods of Pensacola, Cantonment, FL   1   $       500.00 
Kelley Foods, Elba, AL      4           113,700.00 
Proview Foods LLC, Gainesville, GA    2         9,700.00 
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL     3     161,900.00 
US Foodservice-Montgomery, Montgomery, AL              2                  68,200.00 

 
                

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 
 
$354,000.00 Est. / 10 Mos.  Food Services Fund (4110) 
 

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid     Responses Received: 8 
 
  

DATE AND TIME POSTED: 
 
September 7, 2012, 10:00 AM CST 
 

 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Blvd.  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE:  August 21, 2012
BID NBR:   130403
BID TITLE:  Miscellaneous Food Items

If two prices are listed, top price is portion or unit cost, i.e. each, can, lb; bottom price is vendor unit of
issue (lb. case).  Difference in Pack Size Requires Item to be awarded by portion/individual unit.

ITEM
Tenders sv Juice Cup ea Light gl

Quantity: 100 cs 1,000 cs 250 cs 200 cs
0516650 0501030 0517470 0507040

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
Butler Foods of Pensacola No bid No bid No bid No bid
Pensacola, FL
Global Foods No bid No bid No bid No bid
Las Vegas, NV
Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.6716 No bid 0.2624 8.9850
Elba, AL 30.22 25.19 35.94
The Merchants Company 0.8363 No bid No bid No bid
Hattiesburg, MS 33.45
Proview Foods LLC 0.6000 m No bid No bid No bid
Gainesvile, GA 27.00
The Ridgefield's Brand Corp No bid No bid 0.3125 No bid
Montgomery Village, MD 26.25
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.8300 No bid 0.2703 7.0000 a
Geneva, AL 33.20 25.95 28.00 Y
US Foods 0.4904 No bid No bid No bid
Montgomery, AL 22.56

Not Awarded
Items 1 and 14 awarded as a lot

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

Chicken Applesauce Frozen Fruit Mayonnaise,
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ITEM
Sheeted ea ea Whole Wheat ea Whole Grain ea

Quantity: 2,000 cs 2,000 cs 2,000 cs 2,000 cs
0517510 0517510

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Butler Foods of Pensacola No bid No bid No bid No bid
Pensacola, FL
Global Foods 2.3150 u 2.1950 u 2.2450 u 2.3500 u
Las Vegas, NV 27.78 39.51 40.41 28.20
Kelley Foods of Alabama No bid No bid No bid No bid
Elba, AL
The Merchants Company 1.8455 u 2.3833 No bid No bid
Hattiesburg, MS 40.60 42.90
Proview Foods LLC No bid No bid No bid No bid
Gainesvile, GA
The Ridgefield's Brand Corp No bid No bid No bid No bid
Montgomery Village, MD
Sysco Gulf Coast 1.6250 Y 2.0667 Y No bid 1.7063 Y
Geneva, AL 29.25 37.20 40.95
US  Foods-Montgomery 1.4086 Y No bid No bid 1.6525 u
Montgomery, AL 30.89 33.05

Not Awarded

ITEM
cn ea Wheat ea Powder cn

Quantity: 250 cs 1,800 cs 1,800 cs 150 cs
0517520 0517510 0517510 0505011

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Butler Foods of Pensacola No bid No bid No bid No bid
Pensacola, FL
Global Foods No bid No bid No bid No bid
Las Vegas, NV
Kelley Foods of Alabama No bid 0.0897 Y 0.0774 Y 8.2417
Elba, AL 25.82 29.74 49.45
The Merchants Company 4.5183 u 0.0977 Y 0.1640 Y No bid
Hattiesburg, MS 27.11 28.15 19.68
Proview Foods LLC No bid No bid No bid No bid
Gainesvile, GA
The Ridgefield's Brand Corp No bid No bid No bid No bid
Montgomery Village, MD
Sysco Gulf Coast 3.8500 u 0.1053 Y 0.0786 Y No bid
Geneva, AL 23.10 26.95 30.20
US  Foods-Montgomery 4.2983 Y 0.0941 Y 0.0805 Y No bid
Montgomery, AL 25.79  27.10 30.90

Pizza Dough, Pizza Dough Pizza Crust, Pizza Dough

Pizza Sauce Roll Dough Roll Dough, Baking 
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ITEM
White gl Breast Fillets ea

Quantity: 76 cs 250 cs
0507110 0516930

ITEM NUMBER 13 14
Butler Foods of Pensacola 1.6250 a No bid
Pensacola, FL 6.50 Y
Global Foods No bid No bid
Las Vegas, NV
Kelley Foods of Alabama 2.9350 0.6787 Y
Elba, AL 11.74 31.22
The Merchants Company 4.1200 0.9075 Y
Hattiesburg, MS 24.72 36.30
Proview Foods LLC No bid 0.6200 Y
Gainesvile, GA 27.90 m
The Ridgefield's Brand Corp No bid No bid
Montgomery Village, MD
Sysco Gulf Coast No bid 1.0225 Y
Geneva, AL 40.90
US  Foods-Montgomery 2.5500 No bid
Montgomery, AL 15.30

a = Alternate Product Bid
m = Minimum Bid by Vendor
Y = Product was approved in Taste Test
u = Unsatisfactory - Product not approved in taste test, no sample sent on alternate bid or bid not
          or alternate not accepted.

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at:
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department

Vinegar, Breaded Chicken
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